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Siemens

Park Electrical Services have 
announced the completion 

of  the acquisition of the  well-
known company within the 
automation industry in Ireland, 
Almeric Ltd. 

Almeric Ltd is the Siemens 
distribution partner for the Republic 
of Ireland and gives Park Electrical 
Services the full support of Siemens 
on the island of Ireland for their 
full range of industrial control and 
automation products.

Established in 1973 in Belfast, Park 
Electrical Services is a leading 
supplier of specialist electrical 
power, control and automation 
products. A commitment to both 
quality electrical supplies and 
industry-leading customer service 
has enabled Park Electrical Services 
to remain one of the industries 
fastest growing Power, Control and 
Automation technical distributor 

of established branches in Belfast, 
Dublin, Glasgow, Aberdeen and 

Value Added Reseller with 
Siemens

"One of the advantages of dealing 
with the Park Electrical Services 

group is the seamless integration 
of quality solutions across the 
complete spectrum of automation, 
drives, power, switchgear, control 
gear, instrumentation and analytical 
equipment” says Gary O’ Callaghan 
CEO Siemens Limited. 

“As a Value Added Reseller for 
Siemens, Park Electrical Services 
receive training, support and 

This in turn allows Park to combine 
leading-edge technology from the 
world’s largest engineering company 
with Park’s legendary devotion to 
customer care” he added. 

Specalised Products

According to Rob McConachie, 

delighted to announce this  further 
strengthening  of our relationship 
with Siemens through our 
acquisition of Almeric.  As proven 
technology leaders and industry 
experts, Siemens work closely with a 
select global network of partners –– 
to ensure that all of our customers 
automation, drive technology and 
power distribution requirements are 
met, everywhere and at any time”.

automation and switchgear 

products and systems.  Any 
products found within a modern 
control system can be found at 
your local Park Electrical Services 

trained to support the full range of 
products that we sell”. 

“Today, Park Electrical Services is 
recognized as a major supplier of 
specialist electrical equipment, with 
all leading brands in stock available 
for purchase at our Trade Counters 
on site, Call our Sales Team, or 
purchase our products on our 
website www.parkelect.co.uk.  

technical distributor in the UK 
and Ireland to be awarded BS5750 
in 1987 and have retained a third 

accreditation ever since, now 
operating to ISO9001:2015.  This 
is in addition to our ISO18001 
and ISO14001 accreditation for 
Environmental Management and 
Health & Safety”.

A commitment to both quality 
electrical equipment and industry-
leading customer service has 
enabled the PES Group to expand 
across the UK and Ireland to service 
the needs of a much broader 
audience.

Park Electrical takes over Siemens 
distribution partner Almeric Ltd

Announcing the Park acquisition of Almeric are  as follows, John Mc Phillips and Kieran Meehan of
Almeric, Rob McConachie, CEO Park Electrical and Gary O’ Callaghan CEO Siemens Limited


